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kepada saya

M. Dian Hikmawan

Dear Ms Linayati Lestari:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Journal of Governance, "Preparation for Indonesian Election 2024
Contest".

Our decision is to: Accepted

We send your article invoice for proofreading and editing. please give your confirmation before the deadline because we nee
schedule. We will send you the letter of acceptance (LoA) and the publishing schedule after your confirmation.

We are waiting for your confirmation until May 23, 2023

Regards
--
M Dian Hikmawan, MA
Editor in Chief, Journal of Governance
Government Department, Universitas Sultan Ageng Tirtayasa, Indonesia
(Scopus ID: 57215670438)
https://orcid.org/0000-0002-9554-8882
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Description Quantity Charge fee 

Proofread & Editing 
Publication 

(Word Count: 6752) Rp 3.436000 

Total Amount Rp 3.436000 
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<linayati@fisip.unrika.ac.id> 19

kepada Dian

Linayati Lestari

Thank you for you accepting our article. 
We will transfer APC's ASAP, and send to you the payment receipt

---------- Forwarded message --------- From: M. Dian Hikmawan <dian.hikmawan@untirta.ac.id> Date: Fri, 19 May 2023 at 08.
Linayati Lestari

Dear Author we remind you about your article process. is there any information about confirmation regarding our previous em
M. Dian Hikmawan

Yes, I confirm.
Linayati Lestari

On Wed, 24 May 2023 at 08.50, M. Dian Hikmawan <dian.hikmawan@untirta.ac.id> wrote: Dear Author we remind you abou
Linayati Lestari
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Dear Author Thank you for your confirmation. we send you LoA and we arrange your article to continue the process for public
M. Dian Hikmawan

---------- Forwarded message --------- From: M. Dian Hikmawan <dian.hikmawan@untirta.ac.id> Date: Wed, 24 May 2023 at 1
Linayati Lestari

Can I change the name of an author? Thank You.
Linayati Lestari

Thank you editor for accepting our article. We have really appreciated your response and process our manuscript.As i emaile
Linayati Lestari

all the names of articles following the first time submit. we cannot change this because all the authors are recorded by the sy
M. Dian Hikmawan

Dear Author Please find our new Volume 8 Issue 2 2023. Thank you for your cooperation. https://jurnal.untirta.ac.id/index.php
M. Dian Hikmawan
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